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COMMUNICATIONS
INTERNATIONAL

An Employee Owned Company

Communications International, Inc.
4450 US Highway 1
VERO BEACH, FL 32967

Bill to

Foley Police Department
200 East Section Avenue
FOLEY, AL 36536

City of Foley

Quotation

Page
Quotation ID
Date
Expiration date
Customer

1of2
Q00014107
04/26/2021
05/23/2021
C001634

Terms
Reference
Requested By
Salesperson

Delivery address

Foley Police Department
200 East Section Avenue
FOLEY, AL 36536

Michael Farrell

Customer to provide POE Network Switch and IP Programming to connect PW building to the Existing Access Control Server at Foley City Hall
location. Access Control Prox cards will be an additional expense item.

Line
ltem Description Quantity Price Discount Net Price Extended Price
S-EIDC32 Door Controller, Intelli-M, Ethernet Enabled, 3 565.00 0% 565.00 1,695.00
Intergrated
S-EIDCMB EIDC Mounting Box 3 25.00 0% 25.00 75.00
CM- All-In-One Fire Rated Electric Strike 2 387.15 0% 387.15 774.30
CXED1579L
1000-DOR Maglock, 1200 Ib, SS Housing, For Surface 1 425.00 0% 425.00 425.00
Mounting On Qutswi
DTK-MRJPOE Surge Protector, Power Over Ethernet, RJ45 3 85.00 0% 85.00 255.00
Connection, CAT5e
B5365E1P00 Reader, MiniProx Wiegand, 125kHz, w/ 3 287.08 0% 287.08 861.24
Cable, Designer Blac
PB5, Request to Exit Button 1 125.00 0% 125.00 125.00
416402-S 22/6, Shielded, Stranded, NonPlenum, 75 0.20 0% 0.20 15.00
Gray/Blue
1585A Cable, Cat5e, 4-pair Plenum Rated, Blue 200 0.42 0% 0.42 84.00
427100-S 18/2, UnShielded, Stranded, NonPlenum, 75 0.15 0% 0.15 11.25
Grey,
Misc Install Materials, Front Desk Push 1 125.00 0% 125.00 125.00
Button
Aiphone, Intercom/Video Door Station and 1 827.08 0% 827.08 827.08
Desktop Monitoring
Labor, Install 3 Access Control Door 1 4,275.00 0% 4,275.00 4,275.00
Locations
Shipping 1 35.00 0% 35.00 35.00
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COMMUNICATIONS QUOtatlon Quotation ID Q00014107
INTERNATIONAL Date 04/26/2021
An Employee Owned Company Expiration date 05/23/2021
Order Acceptance - Please sign below Subtotal $9,5682.87
Sales tax $0.00
Signature Total $9,582.87

Printed name

i Not an Invoice — Do Not Pay

By signing this quotation and/or submitting a purchase order pursuant to this quotation you acknowledge that you have read and agree to be bound by
Communications Internaticnal, Inc.’s terms and conditions of sale, service, and technical support, Orders may be subject to shipping & handling
charges. All warranties are manufacturer's warranties. Terms and Conditions: www.ask4ci.com/termsandconditions



Capital Purchase Worksheet

Directions:
Please complete all questions below and submit to Mike Thompson and Wayne Trawick for approval.

Submitted by: Darrell Russell

Date Submitted: 10/7/2021

Is this purchase listed as a capital purchase in the approved budget? Yes

What amount is approved in the budget for this purchase? 22,000

Description of the item and why the item is needed at this time.

3 Security Door Controllers and all additional equipment listed in the quote o facilitate the security of the Public Works'
Administrative Staff. This has been a project that has been needed for a while, but in the past several years has become an
a more pressing need.

Can your job be performed without the purchase of this item? Please explain below.
No, the safety of our staff is of utmost importance.

Have you obtained any quotes on the purchase to determine if it will come in, at, or below budget? If so, please attach.
Yes, There is a quote from Communications International attached.
We request the appropriation of $9,583 for 3 new door security systems under Account #100-1060-5100.

Is this to replace a current capital asset? No
If so please list below the item being replaced and why it can not be used any longer.
n/a

How do you plan to dispose of the item that is being replaced?
n/a

B o e o S A S A A & S AT S AT ST A SIS & ST A S AT S AT S A SRS A S A S L S o S A s S S A S £ S Y S A7 S L LTET & A & A A S A S 4 -

Approval by City Administrator

Signature and Date

Approval by Council President

Signature and Date

Effective date March 21,1206 ADMINISTRATION\Important Forms\Agenda Request Forms\Door Security System Cap Purch Wrkshtt.xlsx



10/12/21, 2:03 PM City of Foley Mail - FW: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

---------- Forwarded message =--------

From: Michael Thompson <mthompson@cityoffoley.org>

Date: Mon, Oct 11, 2021 at 12:45 PM

Subject: Re: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

To: Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org>, Wayne <wtrawick@trawickb.com>

Cc: Katy Taylor <ktaylor@cityoffoley.org>, Sue Steigerwald <ssteigerwald@cityoffoley.org>, Miranda Bell
<mbell@cityoffoley.org>, Suzanne Kellams <skellams@cityoffoley.org>

looks like a budget of $22k and a quote of about $9k... I'm good,
Mike

On Mon, Oct 11, 2021 at 10:17 AM Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org> wrote:
Mike
Attached is a worksheet and quote for new security at PWS. Gary uses these folks throughout the city. What this will
accomplish is an initial blast with the current glass doors up front. An electric locking mechanism with speaker that will

be controlled by scan card or individual at the front desk. This quote also covers the middle door with an electric swipe
lock. With today's society, | believe we need fo move on this.

Please approve and move it forward to Wayne for the Oct 1gth agenda. Work will began hopefully in November

Thanks

Darrell Russell
Public Works Superintendent
(251) 943-8897 office

From: Deena Townsend [mailto:dtownsend@cityoffoley.org]
Sent: Thursday, October 7, 2021 2:07 PM

To: Darrell Russell

Subject: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

Good afternoon Darrell,

. Attached is the Capital Purchase Worksheet and Quote for the new Door Security System for the three Public Works
doors. If you need anything else, please let me know. Have a great day!

Deena L. Townsend
Administrative Assistant

- City of Foley

- Public Works Department
dtownsend@cityoffoley.org
Phone 251-943-8897

Fax 251-970-2086
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=bf201160c5&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar1605890025385455931%7Cmsg-f%3A1713441559751... 2/3



10/12/21, 2:03 PM City of Foley Mail - FW: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

R
Fﬂley. Deena Townsend <dtownsend@cityoffoley.org>

OFFICIAL EMAIL

FW: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

1 message

Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org> Tue, Oct 12, 2021 at 2:00 PM
To: Deena Townsend <dtownsend@cityoffoley.org>

Darrell Russell
Public Works Superintendent

(251) 943-8897 office

From: Michael Thompson [mailto:mthompson@cityoffoley.org]
Sent: Tuesday, October 12, 2021 1:55 PM

To: Darrell Russell; Katy Taylor; Sue Steigerwald

Subject: Fwd: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

---------- Forwarded message =-==-==--

From: Wayne <wtrawick@trawickb.com>

Date: Tue, Oct 12, 2021 at 1:37 PM

Subject: RE: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote
To: Michael Thompson <mthompson@cityoffoley.org=>

I'm Good for the agenda

Wayne

From: Michael Thompson <mthompson@cityoffoley.org>

Sent: Tuesday, October 12, 2021 11:54 AM

To: Wayne <wtrawick@trawickb.com>

Subject: Fwd: FW: Door Security System Cap Purch Wrksht & Quote

Hi Wayne, were you good with this request?

Mike

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=bf201160c5&view=ptdsearch=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar1605890025385455931%7Cmsg-{%3A1713441559751...
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