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Resolution: 22- 1012- RES

File Number:  22- 0022 Enactment Number:  22- 1012- RES

Resolution Approving Going to Bid and Purchasing Electric Vehicles for Public Works

and Commercial Sanitation.

WHEREAS, The Public Works and the Commercial Sanitation( 4012) are requesting to

solicit bids for and purchase electric vehicles, AND

WHEREAS, The electric vehicles will be additions to their fleet and were budgeted in FY22,

AND

WHEREAS, Public Works budgeted$ 43, 000.00 under Account# 100- 1060- 5100 for an

Electric Truck," AND

WHEREAS, Sanitation Commercial ( 4012) budgeted$ 43, 000. 00 for an" Electric Truck

Supervisor)" which will be under Account# 601- 1951,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Foley, Alabama, as
follows:

SECTION 1:   Approves going to bid for two new electric vehicles since both were

budgeted in FY22 and will be additions to the fleet.

SECTION 2:   Approves the purchase of two new electric vehicles for a total cost of

86,000.00- one for Public Works in the amount of$ 43, 000. 00 under Account#

100- 1060- 5100; and one for Sanitation Commercial( 4012) in the amount of$ 43, 000. 00

under Account# 601- 1951 that is budgeted to be financed with other Commercial Sanitation

startup capital equipment.

SECTION 3:   This Resolution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption as

required by law.

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 18th day of January 2022.
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File Number.  22- 0022 Enactment Number:  22- 1012-RES

Attest by Clerk
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Capital Purchase Worksheet

Directions:

Please complete all questions below and submit to Mike Thompson and Wayne Trawick for approval.

Submitted by:      Darrell Russell

Date Submitted:   10/ 10/ 2022

Is this purchase listed as a capital purchase in the approved budget?     Yes

What amount is approved in the budget for this purchase?     86, 000

Description of the item and why the item is needed at this time.
Requesting to Go to Bid and Purchase electric vehicles for Public Works and Commercial Sanitation( 4012) in the total

amount of$ 86, 000. 00 as additions to the fleet. They were budgeted in FY22
Public Works budgeted$ 43, 000.00 under Acct# 100- 1060- 5100 as an Electric Truck.

Commercial Sanitation( 4012) budgeted$ 43, 000. 00 as an Electric Truck( Supervisor). It will be under Acct# 601- 1951

Can your job be performed without the purchase of this item? Please explain below.
No, we need them since the city has grown. And we are specifically requesting electric vehicles in an effort to reduce the
city' s environmental footprint.

Have you obtained any quotes on the purchase to determine if it will come in, at, or below budget? If so, please attach.
No, we are requesting to go to bid.

Is this to replace a current capital asset?      No

If so please list below the item being replaced and why it can not be used any longer.
n/ a

How do you plan to dispose of the item that is being replaced?
n/ a

Approval by City Administrat
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Signature and Date

Approval by Council President
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Signature and Date
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1/ 11/ 22, 7: 51 AM City of Foley Mail- Fwd: PW& SANI( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht

Fo1èy*    Deena Townsend < dtownsend@cityoffoley. org>
OFFICIAL EMAIL

Fwd: PW & SANI ( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht
1 message

Darrell Russell < drussell@cityoffoley. org>       Tue, Jan 11, 2022 at 7: 49 AM

To: Deena Townsend < dtownsend@cityoffoley. org>

Forwarded message

From: Wayne< wtrawick@trawickb. com>

Date: Tue, Jan 11, 2022, 7: 25 AM

Subject: RE: PW& SANI ( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht
To: Michael Thompson < mthompson@cityoffoley. org>, Darrell Russell < drussell@cityoffoley. org>
Cc: Miranda Bell < mbell@cityoffoley. org>, Sue Steigerwald < ssteggerwald@cityoffoley. org>, Katy Taylor

ktaylor@cityoffoley. org>

I' m good

Wayne

From: Michael Thompson < mthompson@cityoffoley. org>
Sent: Monday, January 10, 2022 3: 09 PM
To: Darrell Russell < drussell@cityoffoley. org>; Wayne < wtrawick@trawickb. com>

Cc: Miranda Bell < mbell@cityoffoley. org>; Sue Steigerwald < ssteigerwald@cityoffoley. org>; Katy Taylor
ktayl o r@cityoffoley. org>

Subject: Re: PW& SANI ( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht

Thank you Darrell.

Wayne, These are the two electric Lightning F150' s for Darrell. I saw where the one for Inspections was requested earlier
this morning as well. If you are fine with this we will move forward.

Mike

On Mon, Jan 10, 2022 at 3: 04 PM Darrell Russell < drussell@cityoffoley. org> wrote:

Mike, I am requesting to go to bid on 2 new EV half ton pickup trucks. One in sanitation and one in the street
department. Budget stands at 43k a piece. If they come in at or under that, we recommend the purchase also.

Please approve and send to Wayne

Thank you

https:// mail. google. com/ mail/ u/ 0/? ik= bf201160c5& view= pt& search= all& permthid= thread- a% 3Ar- 96148501072369768% 7Cmsg- f%3A1 72 1 666321 0459...   1/ 2



1/ 11/ 22, 7: 51 AM City of Foley Mail- Fwd: PW& SANI( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht

Forwarded message

From: Deena Townsend < dtownsend@cityoffoley. org>
Date: Mon, Jan 10, 2022, 11: 13 AM

Subject: PW& SANI ( 4012) Cap Purch Wrksht
To: Darrell Russell < drussell@cityoffoley. org>

Good morning Darrell,

Attached is the Capital Purchase Worksheet for the Electric Trucks for Public Works and
Sanitation ( 4012). I have already completed the Legistar File. When you receive approval to go
ahead, let me know and I will start it. Have a great day!

Deena L. Townsend

Administrative Assistant

City of Foley

Public Works Department

dtownsend@cityoffoley. org

Phone 251- 943- 8897

Fax 251- 970- 2086
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