3/22/23, 8:44 AM City of Foley Mail - Fwd: Sylvane Inc: Quotation #E19650

Cityof

[oleyam

OFFICIAL EMAIL

Fwd: Sylvane Inc: Quotation #E19650

1 message

Jeff Phillips <jphillips@cityoffoley.org>
To: Daisha Barnes <dbarnes@cityoffoley.org>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <supportdesk@sylvane.com>

Date: Mon, Mar 20, 2023 at 10:23 AM
Subject: Sylvane Inc: Quotation #E19650
To: <jphillips@cityoffoley.org>

Cc: <netsuite-sales-receipts@sylvane.com>

&% sylvane

245 Hembree Park Drive, Suite 124
Roswell, GA 30076

800-934-9194

801-469-6774 (fax)
supportdesk@sylvane.com

Bill To
City of Foley (AL)

Daphne AL 36526
United States

Daisha Barnes <dbarnes@cityoffoley.org>

Quotation
Date
3/17/2023

Expires Exp. Close

4/16/2023 3/17/2023

Item QuantityDescription Options

Dri-Eaz LGR 7000XLi

dr2545 3Dehumidifier

Dri-Eaz LGR 3500i

dr2413 1 Dehumidifier

XPOWER X-34AR 1,720
Xp7977 2CFM Professional Axial
Fan

xp13874 1XPOWER X-47ATR 3600
CFM 1/3 HP Axial Air
Mover

Rate

2,750.00

3,750.00

200.00

300.00

AmountShip Address
To
City of
Foley (AL)
Foley AL
36536
United
States
City of
Foley (AL)
Foley AL
36536
United
States
City of
Foley (AL)
Foley AL
36536
United
States
300.00foley City of
Foley (AL)
Foley AL
36536

8,250.00foley

3,750.00foley

400.00foley

Mon, Mar 20, 2023 at 10:29 AM

Quote #
E19650

Project

Ship To  CarrierShip Via

45801386More

45801386More

45801386More

45801386More

FedEx Freight
Economy

FedEx Freight
Economy

FedEx Ground

FedEx Ground

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=ca0f692cfe&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1760901132162315070&simpl=msg-f:1760901132162315070
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mailto:supportdesk@sylvane.com
mailto:jphillips@cityoffoley.org
mailto:netsuite-sales-receipts@sylvane.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/245+Hembree+Park+Drive,+Suite+124%0D%0A+Roswell,+GA+30076?entry=gmail&source=g
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& z’ /e I Quotation
"'u.‘;.‘-._ Sy Va n e Date Quote #
' ' 3/17/2023 E19650
United
States

Subtotal 12,700.00
Tax 1,016.00
Total$13,716.00

Jeff Scott Phillips

Construction Project Manager

Engineering Department

P.0. Box 1750 | 200 West Laurel Ave. Suite 225 | Foley, Alabama 36536
Tel 251.970.1104 | C 251.979.0947 Fax 251.970.2398
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ALABAMA
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https://www.google.com/maps/search/200+West+Laurel+Ave.+Suite+225+%7C+Foley,+Alabama%C2%A0+36536?entry=gmail&source=g
tel:(251)%20970-1104
tel:(251)%20970-2398

