K&K Systems Systems QUOTATION

687 Palmetto Road email: cphillips@k-ksystems.com
Tupelo, MS 38801 Phone: Office 662-566-2025, Cell: 662-542-3182
k- .com Fax: 662-568-7123 TollFree: 888-414-3003
Quotation #: Q170915CP-2 Customer Contact: Darrell Rusself
Quotation Date: 9/15/2017 Quote Valid: 45 days
Customer Type: Retail Prepared by: Chip Phillips
Bill To: Ship To: (Update if different than Bill To address)
Name: Darrell Russell Name: Darrell Russell
Company Name: City of Foley Company Name; City of Foley
Street Address: Public Works Street Address: Public Works
Address 2: 120 E. Orehid Avenue Address 2: 120 E. Orchid Averue
City, ST ZIP Code Foley, AL 36535 City, ST ZIP Code Foley, AL 36535
Tel: 251-943-8897 Tel: 251-g43-8807
Cell: Cell:
Fax: Fax:
email:_drussell@cityaffoley.org email: drussell@cityofioley.org
MB14281 Solar Powered, Portable Changeable Message Sign. Capable of three lines of $13,850.00

alphanumeric 18" high text and graphics/animations, all LED display, self
contained on board computer, multiple alphanumeric fonts, powder coat paint
system. Display is 142" x 81", with hydraulic style trailer, Supports up to 260
predefined messages (text and graphics). Supports storage of up to 100
changeable messages. System comes standard with six (6) 6-volt batteries

Elota!'mﬁ 675 12V amasl and 220 watts of solar. NTCIP ComEﬁanl.
—y

Packaging K&K Delivers == =
Options and Accessories - PER UNIT

1 ST Site tube, BID
1 TBPR Pintle ring hitch coupler & adjustable height channel. Included

ALDOT "Roadway Work Zone Safety Equipment” Bid
No.: 16-X-2271267
T Number: T171

Special Notes
Terms of Purchase Per System Total: $13,850.00
FOB: Tupelo, MS 38801 Total QTY of Systems: 1 $13,850.00
Delivery (weeks): 4-6 Weeks Total Shipping Costs: Included
Warranty: 1 year limited warranty, Factory Depot Taxes:

GRAND TOTAL: $13,850.00
Sales Person Signature: Chip Phillips Work Orderi# ENTER WO #
Sales M'an_aﬁer ngnafure: Timothy Keith Client PO# ENTER PO #

Please note: The above specifications and quotation does not include shipping, permits, or taxes unless otherwise stated. The freight charge is an
approximate estimate for your reference; the actual charge may vary.There will be an additional 3% charge on all credit card orders unless otherwise stated
*Lead-time committed is based on the date Purchase Order is received by K&K Systems and deposit made and/or credit approved. Lead time is not based on
the date quoted,



Deena Townsend

From: Darrell Russell [drussell@cityoffoley.org]

Sent: Friday, September 15, 2017 11:06 AM

To: Deena Townsend

Subject: FW: K&K Systems-Quote for Darrell Russell, City of Foley
Attachments: Q170915CP-2-AL-City of Foley-BID - Quote Form.pdf

From: Elaina Strickland [mailto:estrickland @k-ksystems.com]

Sent: Friday, September 15, 2017 11:05 AM

To: Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org>; Chip Phillips <cphillips @k-ksystems.com>
Subject: K&K Systems-Quote for Darrell Russell, City of Foley

Good Morning!

As per your conversation with Chip, attached is a new quote for (1) MB14281 per ALDOT Contract. If you have any
questions, please call or email. We'll be happy to help! Thank you and have a wonderful day!!!
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