Capital Purchase Worksheet

Directions:
Please complete all questions below and submit to Mike Thompson and Wayne Trawick for approval.

Submitted by: Darrell Russell

Date Submitted: 10/12/2020

Is this purchase listed as a capital purchase in the approved budget? Yes

What amount is approved in the budget for this purchase? 50,000.00

Description of the item and why the item is needed at this time.
2006 Vactor 2100 Series Vac Truck for clearing culverts. It is much needed now for the regular, typical maintenance
of culverts and drainage lines and will be needed when the MS4 regulations hit us.

Can your job be performed without the purchase of this item? Please explain below.
No, the city has grown and there are many more culverts that affect drainage so we need it to clear the blockages. We will
also need it to meet MS4 regulations in the near future

Have you obtained any quotes on the purchase to determine if it will come in, at, or below budget? If so, please attach.
Yes and Yes.

We request the appropriation of $35,000 for the 2006 Vactor 2100 Series Vac Truck under Account #100-3011-5100.

Is this to replace a current capital asset? No
If so please list below the item being replaced and why it can not be used any longer.

How do you plan to dispose of the item that is being replaced?
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Approval by City Administrator

Signature and Date

Approval by Council President

Signature and Date

Effective date March 21, 2016 U:# 1 ADMINISTRATION\Important Forms\Agenda Request Forms\ST CNSTR 2006 VAC TRK .xlsx



10/12/2020 City of Foley Mail - FW: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

FOley. Deena Townsend <dtownsend@cityoffoley.org>
OFFICIAL EMAIL

FW: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

1 message

Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Oct 12, 2020 at 10:11 AM
To: Deena Townsend <dtownsend@cityoffoley.org>

Darrell Russell

Public Works Superintendent

(251) 943-8897 office

From: Aaron Parker [mailto:aparker@rivierautilities.com]
Sent: Monday, October 12, 2020 7:26 AM

To: 'Darrell Russell’

Cc: Larry Waters; Richard Rider; Keith Bixler

Subject: RE: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

Darrell,

| was talking to JJ Kane Auction about the truck and they were saying | could get anywhere from 30-40 thousand for the
truck. How about meeting in the middle at $35,000 for the Vac truck. Let me know what you think.

Thank you

Aaron Parker

Riviera Utilities

Superintendent of Transportation
251-970-4154 Office
251-269-1606 Cell

From: Darrell Russell <drussell@cityoffoley.org>
Sent: Thursday, October 8, 2020 1:51 PM
To: Aaron Parker <aparker@rivierautilities.com>
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10/12/2020 City of Foley Mail - FW: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

Cc: Larry Waters <lwaters@privierautilities.com>; Richard Rider <rrider@cityoffoley.org>; Keith Bixler
<kbixler@cityoffoley.org>
Subject: RE: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

*#%The e-mail below is from outside Riviera Utilities or not authenticated***

Yes sir. | was waiting to talk to you because of Sally. | have money budgeted and your unit is what we are looking for. |
have copied my street supervisor and crew leader. They will be the ones to inspect it. If you would, let me know the cost
so | can go to council and get it approved. We can come look at it when it is convenient for you. Let me know

thanks

27

Darrell Russell

Public Works Superintendent

(251) 943-8897 office

?7?

From: Aaron Parker [mailto:aparker@rivierautilities.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 8, 2020 1:44 PM

To: 'drussell@cityoffoley.org’

Cc: Larry Waters

Subject: Riviera Utilities 2006 Vac Truck

?7?
Darrell,
??

Larry Waters was telling me that the City of Foley may be interested in our 2006 ??Vactor 2100 Series Truck??? If the
City is still interested in it, let me know.?? We can setup a day and you can come check it out.

??

??

Thank you??

??

??

??

??

Aaron Parker
Riviera Utilities
Superintendent of Transportation
251-970-4154 Office

251-269-1606 Cell

??
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