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Cityoffoley.org Mail

Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org>

updated expenses on CAFFM

Jeff Rouzie <jrouzie@cityoffoley.org> Tue, Oct 1, 2013 at 2:33 PM
To: Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org>

See ALTA survey cost of $4,000 quote John Peterson Hatchmont McDonald this must be done for the NMTC Financing .

Jeff

Jeff Rouzie
 Director of Economic Development
City of Foley
407 East Laurel Ave.
Foley, AL 36535
251-943-1545 (Phone)
251-952-4012 (Fax)
jrouzie@cityoffoley.org
www.cityoffoley.org

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Joe Bridges <bridges@hoar.com>
Date: Thu, Sep 26, 2013 at 10:59 AM
Subject: RE: updated expenses on CAFFM
To: Jeff Rouzie <jrouzie@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: James Adams <jadams@hoarpm.com>

Jeff,

 

Attached is the info we attained from Hatch Mott.  Their price to provide an ALTA survey for Parcel 2 is $4000; $2750 for
topo and $1250 for as-built of parking and drives.

 

When we met yesterday, Myles said he had a few updates for the activity master.  As soon as I receive those from him, I
will send the update.

 

Let me know if there is anything else we can do.

 

Thanks,
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2 attachments

271166_WilsonPecanPlat_RM_2D.PDF
1171K

plat.pdf
407K

Joe Bridges LEED AP BD+C
HOAR Program Management

 

From: Jeff Rouzie [mailto:jrouzie@cityoffoley.org] 
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2013 10:21 AM
To: Steven Hattier
Cc: Donna Poole; Joe Bridges
Subject: updated expenses on CAFFM

 

Steven:

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/ca/?ui=2&ik=238f126b18&view=att&th=1417582d77cd396b&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=b7d64290c33ebc31_0.1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/ca/?ui=2&ik=238f126b18&view=att&th=1417582d77cd396b&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=b7d64290c33ebc31_0.2&safe=1&zw
mailto:jrouzie@cityoffoley.org
mailto:jrouzie@cityoffoley.org
mailto:jrouzie@cityoffoley.org

	Local Disk
	Cityoffoley.org Mail - updated expenses on CAFFM


