City of Foley Monthly Bid Awards
Submitted by: Rachel Keith
January 2016

PLANT AND MATERIALS
FOR THE FOLEY DOG PARK
Requisition No. DOGPK-010516C

January 5, 2016 @ 2:00 p.m.

PLANTS
SUMMIT
LANDSCAPE
SUPPLY, INC.
ITEM PLANT NAME SIZE DETAILS | UNIT COST
Live Oak Quercus virginiana | 45 gallon 10-12’ H $227.00
Live Oak Quercus virginiana | 30 gallon 8-10'H
Red Maple Acer rubrum 45 gallon 10-12'H
Red Maple Acer rubrum 30 gallon 8-10'H $110.00
Bald Cypress Taxodium distichum | 45 gallon 10-12’H $195.00
Bald Cypress Taxodium distichum | 30 gallon 8-10'H $110.00
Drake EIm Ulmus parvifolia 45 gallon 3" CAL $227.00
‘Drake’

Natchez Crape Lagerstroemia x 45 gallon 10-12’H $112.00
Myrtle ‘Natchez’

3 trunks
Natchez Crape Lagerstroemia x 30 gallon 8-10'H $85.00
Myrtle ‘Natchez’

3 trunks
Natchez Crape Lagerstroemia x 15 gallon 6-8'H $55.00
Myrtle ‘Natchez’ 3 trunks
Muskogee Crape Lagerstroemia x 45 gallon 10-12’H $112.00
Myrtle ‘Muskogee’

3 trunks
Muskogee Crape Lagerstroemia x 30 gallon 8-10'H $85.00
Myrtle ‘Muskogee’

3 trunks
Muskogee Crape Lagerstroemia x 15 gallon 6-8'H $55.00
Myrtle ‘Muskogee’ 3 trunks
Autumn Lily Azalea | Azalea Encore 3 gallon $12.75
or approved ‘Autumn Lily’
substitution
Knock-Out Rose or | Rosa shrub 3 gallon $13.50
approved ‘Radrazz’ TM
substitution
Drift Rose or Coral Drift 3 gallon $13.35
approved
substitution
Drift Rose or Coral Drift 1 gallon
approved
substitution




ITEM PLANT NAME SIZE DETAILS | UNIT COST

Breeze Grass Lomandra longifolia | 3 gallon $8.25
‘Breeze’

Breeze Grass Lomandra longifolia | 1 gallon $3.70
‘Breeze’

Evergreen Giant Liriope muscari 1 gallon $2.50

Liriope or approved | ‘Evergreen Giant’

substitution

Award made to Summit Landscape Supply, Inc. (Sole Bidder)

BENCHES, TRASH RECEPTACLES, PET WASTE STATIONS
AND MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FOR THE FOLEY DOG PARK
Requisition No. DOGPK-010516A
January 5, 2016 @ 2:00 p.m.

KEYSTONE RIDGE DESIGNS, INC.
ITEM UNIT PRICE DELIVERY TIMEFRAME
" ITEM DESCRIPTION (INCLUDES DELIVERY TO FrROM
THE CITY OF FOLEY) DATE OF ORDER
1 | Lamplighter Series Bench
with back, 6’ $ 1,592.00 9 to 10 weeks
2 Plastisol Coated Curved Rod No Bid No Bid
Bench, 4’
3 Plastisol Coated Curved Rod No Bid No Bid
Bench, 6’
No Bid No Bid
4 Trash Receptacle
No Bid No Bid
5 Standard Pet Waste Stations
6 | Standard Pet Waste Bag No Bid No Bid
Dispenser
7 | Tough Guy Automatic Float No Bid No Bid
Waterer

Award was made to Keystone Ridge Designs, Inc. (Sole Bidder)




SANDSTONE BOULDERS, FOUNTAINS AND
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FOR THE FOLEY DOG PARK
Requisition No. DOGPK-010516B
January 5, 2106

FRAN’S ON 59
ITEM UNIT PRICE
# ITEM DESCRIPTION (INCLUDES DELIVERY TO

THE CITY OF FOLEY)

1 | Large Sandstone Boulder

Irregular 3’ x 5’ x 20” high $275.00 each
2 Large Sandstone Boulder
Irregular 2’ x 5’ x 20” high $260.00 each
3 Stone Bench
47" x 15" x 3" thick x 16" $240.00 each
high
Stone Bench
4 60" x 18" x 4 ¥2" thick x 16" $300.00 each
high
Stone Drinking Fountain
5 Irregular bowl $810.00 each

6 Small Pot and Water
Pump

10" diameter x 11" high on
2 ft. sqg. base

7 Flagstones
Approximately 80 sq. ft. $4.00/sq. ft.

$290.00 each

8 Decomposed Granite
Approximately 9 cy $140.00/cy
9 1" x 3” Steel Pins
Approximately 60 $.09/ea
10 | Composite Deck Board
Approximately 6 pcs. N/A

Award made to Fran’s on 59 (Sole Bidder)




BUILDING MAINTENANCE TRUCK CHASSIS
Requisition No. MUN-011316
January 13, 2016 @ 2:00 P.M.

VENDORS UNIT PRICE NOTE
1) | Stivers Ford Lincoln $25,677.54
Bid is within the
allowance for the
2) | Moyer Ford $26,038.00 local bid
preference
3) | Donohoo Chevrolet $27,861.30
4) | Bay Chevrolet Inc. No Response
5) Chuck Stevens No Response
Chevrolet
6) | Chuck Stevens Ford No Response
7) | Gulf Chrysler No Response
8) Landers McLarty Dodge | No Response
Chrysler Jeep Ram
9) Terry Thompson No Response
Chevrolet

Stivers Ford Lincoln submitted the lowest bid; however, when the local preference is
applied, Moyer Ford Sales’ bid is within the 5% local preference. Award will be made to

Moyer Ford Sales in the amount of $26,038.00.

NEW FENCE, BATTING CAGES, BACKSTOP NETTING

Requisition Number - REC-011316
January 13, 2016

VENDORS TOTAL PRICE
1 | Mobile Fence Company $64,457.00
2 | Capitol Fence $69,800.00
3 | Consolidated Fence $129,678.00

Award made to Mobile Fence Company.
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