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Cityof

FOley. Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org>

OFFICIAL EMAIL

Fwd: County Road 12 Widening Bid Tab

6 messages

Chad Christian <cchristian@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 7:58 AM

To: Ralph Hellmich <rhellmich@cityoffoley.org>, Michael Thompson <mthompson@cityoffoley.org>, Wayne Dyess
<wdyess@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: Taylor Davis <Tdavis@cityoffoley.org>, Donna Poole <dpoole@(cityoffoley.org>

FYI. We will move to award the project next agenda.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Tony Schachle <tschachle@rivierautilities.com>

Date: Mon, Mar 7, 2022, 7:56 AM

Subject: RE: County Road 12 Widening Bid Tab

To: Chad Christian <cchristian@cityoffoley.org>

Cc: Taylor Davis <Tdavis@cityoffoley.org>, Jeff Phillips <jphillips@cityoffoley.org>, Keven Williams
<kwilliams@rivierautilities.com>, Jason Skelton <jskelton@rivierautilities.com>

Chad,

Riviera will fund Item 29. Send us an invoice once the work is complete and we will cut a check to the City.

Thanks,

Tony

From: Chad Christian <cchristian@cityoffoley.org>

Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 4:51 PM

To: Tony Schachle <tschachle@rivierautilities.com>; Keven Williams <kwilliams@rivierautilities.com>; Jason
Skelton <jskelton@rivierautilities.com>

Cc: Taylor Davis <Tdavis@cityoffoley.org>; Jeff Phillips <jphillips@cityoffoley.org>

Subject: Fwd: County Road 12 Widening Bid Tab

CAUTION:This email originated from outside of Riviera Utilities. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Gentlemen, please see attached. We are over budget and the Mayor has directed me to request that Riviera fund item 29
to upgrade the water line. Thanks and please advise.
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Rachel Keith <rkeith@cityoffoley.org>

Date: Tue, Mar 1, 2022 at 10:52 AM

Subject: County Road 12 Widening Bid Tab

To: Chad Christian <cchristian@cityoffoley.org>, Taylor Davis <tdavis@cityoffoley.org>, Jeff Phillips
<jphillips@cityoffoley.org>, David Dichiara <dichiara@edgalabama.com>

Attached for your review is the bid tab for the County Road 12 Widening project and John G. Walton’s bid packet.

Rachel Keith

City of Foley

Project, Risk & Airport Manager
407 E. Laurel Avenue

Foley, AL 36535

251-970-2418

Chad P. Christian, P.E.
City Engineer

City of Foley Engineering Dept.
PO. Box 1750 | 200 N. Alston St.
Foley, AL 36536

p: 251-970-1104

F: 251-970-2398

FOLEY
B CounTs!

census.alabama.gov

Michael Thompson <mthompson@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 8:09 AM

To: Chad Christian <cchristian@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: Ralph Hellmich <rhellmich@cityoffoley.org>, Wayne Dyess <wdyess@cityoffoley.org>, Taylor Davis
<Tdavis@qcityoffoley.org>, Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org>

excellent Chad.
Mike
[Quoted text hidden]

Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 9:11 AM

To: Rachel Keith <rkeith@cityoffoley.org>
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Good morning Rachel,
Would you please send me the bid tab for CR 12 widening and John G Waltons's bid
packet? I'm doing the agenda item and need this for my backup.

Thank you,

Donna Poole

Administrative Assistant IV

Engineering Department

P.O. Box 1750 | 200 W. Laurel Ave. | Foley, Alabama 36536
Tel 251.970.1104 | Fax 251-952-4014

0

ALABAMA

[Quoted text hidden]

Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 9:24 AM

To: Logan Eberly <leberly@cityoffoley.org>

Good morning Logan,
| see Rachel is out of the office this week so could you send me the bid tab for CR 12
widening and John G Waltons's bid packet?

Thank you,

Donna Poole

Administrative Assistant IV

Engineering Department

P.O. Box 1750 | 200 W. Laurel Ave. | Foley, Alabama 36536
Tel 251.970.1104 | Fax 251-952-4014

0

ALABAMA

[Quoted text hidden]

Logan Eberly <leberly@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 9:51 AM

To: Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: Rachel Keith <rkeith@cityoffoley.org>

Hi Donna,

Attached is the bid packet and the bid tab. John G Walton was the only bidder.

Thank you,
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Logan Eberly

City of Foley

Grants & Special Agreements Administrator
407 East Laurel Avenue

PO Box 1750

Foley, AL 36536

(P) 251-970-1867 (F) 251-952-4014

leberly@cityoffoley.org

(ityof

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

E John G Walton Bid - CR 12 Widening.pdf
7737K

@ Bid Tab - County Road 12 Widening.xlIsx
127K

Donna Poole <dpoole@cityoffoley.org> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 9:52 AM
To: Logan Eberly <leberly@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: Rachel Keith <rkeith@cityoffoley.org>

Thank you Logan.

Thank you,

Donna Poole

Administrative Assistant [V

Engineering Department

P.O. Box 1750 | 200 W. Laurel Ave. | Foley, Alabama 36536
Tel 251.970.1104 | Fax 251-952-4014
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