11/14/22, 9:17 AM City of Foley Mail - Fwd: 200 E Section Uniti Fiber Relo

Cityof

FOley . Daisha Barnes <dbarnes@cityoffoley.org>

OFFICIAL EMAIL

Fwd: 200 E Section Uniti Fiber Relo

2 messages

Jeff Phillips <jphillips@cityoffoley.org> Wed, Oct 26, 2022 at 4:57 PM
To: Daisha Barnes <dbarnes@cityoffoley.org>

pd item to lower fiber
we might cover under a po through pd

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Evin Bowling <Evin.Bowling@uniti.com>
Date: Fri, Oct 21, 2022 at 9:19 AM

Subject: 200 E Section Uniti Fiber Relo

To: jphillips@cityoffoley.org <jphillips@cityoffoley.org>
Cc: Ethan Stokley <Ethan.Stokley@uniti.com>

Hey Jeff,
We need the following information to create a work order in our system:

Customer name :

- Billing address

- Physical address (If different):

- Name of the individual that needs to receive the bill:
- Email of the individual or entity receiving the bill:

The cost will be $8,500. This includes construction, splicing, and materials.

Thanks,

Evin Bowling

Site Acquisition Coordinator/Technician
C 251.769.2339

tech support (NOC): 877.652.2321

107 St. Francis St
Mobile, AL 36602
uniti.com
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