E ] City of

Monthly Bid Awards

Submitted by: Rachel Keith
FEBRUARY 2022

THREE (3) NEW ELECTRIC TRUCKS FOR COF PUBLIC WORKS AND CDD DEPARTMENTS
FEBRUARY 3, 2022 @ 11:00AM

Item Description Moyer Ford
Electric Truck (Price Each) $35,999.00
Total Price (3 Trucks) $107,997.00

Bid awarded to Moyer Ford.

CITY OF FOLEY STREETS & DRAINAGE - 2021
FEBRUARY 3, 2022 @ 11:00AM

McElhenney Asphalt Services | John G Walton | HCL Contracting
Base Bid $1,037,400.44 $1,057,361.00 $1,351,043.77 $1,178,109.78
Addendum #1 $40,752.00 $36,000.00 $54,000.00 $17,280.00
Total Price $1,078,152.44 $1,093,361.00 $1,405,043.77 $1,195,389.78

Bid awarded to McElhenney.

825 B — BASE & STONE

FEBRUARY 17, 2022 11:00AM

Item Description Martin Marietta | Terraform Land Co

825 B-Base (Picked up by City) $36.25 $48.50
825 B-Base (Delivered to City) $49.25 $49.50
57 Stone (Picked up by City) $37.25 $49.50
57 Stone (Delivered to City) $50.25 $50.50
67 Stone (Picked up by City) $37.25 No Bid
67 Stone (Delivered to City) $50.25 No Bid
Class 2 RipRap (Picked up by City) $53.25 No Bid
Class 2 RipRap (Delivered to City) $66.25 No Bid

Bids awarded to both Martin Marietta (1) and Terraform (2").




BASEBALL & SOFTBALL ATHLETIC UNIFORMS
FEBRUARY 23, 2022 @ 2:00PM

Item Description Off the Wall Riddell

Baseball Subtotal $18,609.00 $21,642.62

Softball Subtotal $11,727.00 $11,613.03
Total Price $30,336.00 $33,255.65

Bid awarded to Off the Wall.




