9/9/2014 Cityoffoley.org Mail - 14-0673 Backup Documentation

Haty Taylor <ltaylor@eaeity offolayv.orgy

14'-0673 Backup Documentation

Jessica Middleton <jmiddleton@cityoffoley.org> Tue, Sep 9, 2014 at 1:54 PM
To: Katy Taylor <ktaylor@cityoffoley.org>

Katy, There is no real backup. Funds will be used for miscellaneous supplies to include poles,
concrete, fasteners, etc. I do not have exact part numbers or quantities at this time.

Thanks,

Jessica Middleton

IS Manager

City of Foley

(251) 943-4141 % 299
jmiddleton@cityoffoley.org

On Tue, Sep 9, 2014 at 1:48 PM, Katy Taylor <ktaylor@cityoffoley.org> wrote:
Jessica,

Is there any backup for your item 14-06737 If not, | will use this email as backup.

Thanks
Katy

Katy Taylor || Assistant City Clerk || City of Foley
407 East Laurel Avenue Foley, Alabama 36535 ||
251.943.1545 || ktaylor@cityoffoley.org
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