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Hi Ladonna,
| am fine with bringing this to council.
Mike

On Fri, Sep 1, 2023 at 3:45 PM LaDonna Hinesley <lhinesley@cityoffoley.org> wrote:
Hi Mike,
I'm working on a resolution to memorialize funding that was used to upgrade the lighting in the Railroad Museum exhibit
hall. The total amount of the project was $7,162.04. Finance flagged it as it exceeds the $5,000 capital projects
threshold.
I'm requesting permission to take this to council to move the funds from operations to capital.
The permission request is attached.
By the way, this project looks amazing. $6,200 of it came from a grant from the Alabama Historic Commission. We have
a new exhibit that will be going in within the next two weeks. We plan to do a big reveal when it is all completed.
LaDonna

LaDonna Hinesley
Marketing Director
City of Foley
251-943-1200
www.VisitFoley.org
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